
GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS & MATS

JANUARY 19, 2010 @ 2:00P.M.
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY VENDOR

Uni-First Cintas G&K Services Aramark AmeriPride Sitex
Lease

Work Shirts $2.09 $0.98 NO BID $2.25 $2.75 $1.50
Polo Shirts $2.09 $1.49 NO BID $2.50 $3.30 $1.50

T-shirts $1.76 $0.75 NO BID NO BID $2.75 $1.50
Jackets $0.25 $0.40 NO BID $0.25 $0.25 $0.25

Cost of Emblems $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Replacement Uniforms

Work Shirts $9.99 $11.00 NO BID $14.00 $12.50 $10.00
Polo Shirts $10.99 $13.00 NO BID $14.00 $14.50 $10.00

T-shirts $9.89 $9.00 NO BID NO BID $5.50 $8.00
Jackets $24.99 $22.00 NO BID $26.00 $25.00 $32.00

Cost of Adding Employee $0.00 $5.48 NO BID $30.00 $20.00 $14.00
Cost of Uniform Changes $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $2.72 $1.00 $1.00

$154.44 $94.44 $166.50 $201.30 $115.50
Lease/Purchase

Work Shirts $1.87 NO BID $2.25 $2.75 $2.00
Polo Shirts $1.87 NO BID $2.50 $3.30 $2.00

T-shirts $1.54 NO BID NO BID $2.75 $2.00
Jackets $0.25 NO BID $0.25 $0.25 $0.50

Cost of Emblems $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Replacement Uniforms

Work Shirts $9.99 NO BID $14.00 $12.50 $18.00
Polo Shirts $10.99 NO BID $14.00 $14.50 $12.00

T-shirts $9.89 NO BID NO BID $5.50 $5.00
Jackets $24.99 NO BID $26.00 $25.00 $35.00

Cost of Adding Employee $0.00 NO BID $30.00 $20.00 $14.00
Cost of Uniform Changes $0.00 NO BID $2.72 $1.00 $1.00

Purchase
Work Shirts $15.99 $24.00 NO BID $14.00 $12.50 $18.00
Polo Shirts $14.99 $19.00 NO BID $14.00 $14.50 $12.00

T-shirts $13.99 $11.00 NO BID $15.00 $5.50 $5.00
Jackets $49.00 $35.00 NO BID $26.00 $25.00 $35.00

$93.97 $89.00 $69.00 $57.50 $70.00
Mats

4 x 6 Mat $2.15 $2.00 NO BID $2.79 $2.25 $1.75
3 x 10 Mat $2.85 $2.95 NO BID $3.29 $2.50 $2.50
3 x 4 Mat $1.15 NO BID NO BID $1.89 $1.05 $1.50
3 x 5 Mat $1.15 $1.75 NO BID NO BID $1.05 $1.50
Wet Mop $0.95 $0.80 NO BID $1.49 $1.00 $1.75
Dry Mop $1.15 $0.80 NO BID $0.89 $1.25 $1.25

Air Freshener Cabinet $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $2.00 $0.00 $2.00
Air Freshener Refills $1.20 $2.75 NO BID $0.00 $1.05 $0.00

$98.70 $101.50 $125.63 $96.90 $102.00
LOW BID


