CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: December 20, 2024 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson Border States
BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS
3/4" x 1" Coupling . .
Ford #C44-34Q-NL 25 $25.20 $24.49 $23.57 No Bid $23.82 $23.50 $22.75 $23.68 No Bid
3/4" Meter Valve . .
Ford #B43-232W-Q-NL 100 $58.20 $51.98 $50.04 No Bid $50.56 $49.92 $48.34 $50.27 No Bid
3/4" Meter Coupling 25 $15.25 $11.45 $10.82 No Bid $10.93 $10.78 $10.44 $10.87 No Bid
Ford #C38-23-2-NL
3/4" Meter Coupling 50 $28.85 $13.88 $13.11 No Bid $13.25 $13.07 $12.66 $13.17 No Bid
Ford #C38-23-3-NL
3/4" Swivel, 45° Bend 10 $60.40 $26.56 $25.57 No Bid $25.84 $25.52 $24.71 $25.69 No Bid
Ford #LA104-33S-NL
3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp . .
Ford #B44-233W-O-NL 100 $54.45 $49.69 $47.83 No Bid $48.33 $47.70 $46.20 $48.06 No Bid
3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Tee . .
Ford #T444-333Q-NL 50 $52.50 $51.47 $49.08 No Bid $49.59 $48.96 $47.41 $49.31 No Bid
3/4" Brass Coupling 25 $4.50 $4.52 No Bid No Bid $3.00 $4.45 $4.32 $3.47 No Bid
3/4" Brass 90° 25 $5.55 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $3.73 $5.57 $5.39 $4.29 No Bid
1" Meter Valve 25 $136.65 $95.71 $92.13 No Bid $93.09 $91.83 $88.93 $92.56 No Bid
Ford #B43-344W-Q-NL ’ ' ' ' ' ’ ’
1" Male Adapter 50 $22.15 $21.26 $19.72 No Bid $19.93 $19.67 $19.05 $19.82 No Bid
Ford #C84-44Q-NL ) : : . . o .
1" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp . .
Ford #B44-444W-Q-NL 25 $128.50 $119.55 $112.94 No Bid $114.12 $112.61 $109.05 $113.47 No Bid
1" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 $11.75 $13.65 No Bid No Bid $9.16 $12.28 $11.90 $10.85 No Bid
2" Brass Coupling 10 $22.50 $23.15 No Bid No Bid $15.96 $23.75 $23.00 $18.41 No Bid
3/4" x 7" Meter Resetter . .
Ford #V42-7TW-NL 150 $108.70 $107.01 $103.00 No Bid $104.08 $113.86 $129.63 $103.49 No Bid
2" Copper Setter . . .
McDonald #720-715WNEE-770 25 No Bid $1,238.77 $1,163.00 No Bid $968.77 $955.88 $945.93 $963.30 No Bid
1" Corporation Stop . .
Ford #FB100-4-Q-NL 25 $77.75 $74.12 $70.68 No Bid $71.42 $70.45 $68.23 $71.01 No Bid
TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES AND SERVICE SADDLES
8" x 1" Service Saddle - ClI . . . .
Ford #FC202-979-CCA 5 $76.90 $87.05 No Bid No Bid $80.13 No Bid $109.51 $80.87 No Bid
10" x 3/4" Service Saddle - Cl . . . .
Ford #£C202-1212-CC3 5 $108.00 $105.10 No Bid No Bid $96.75 No Bid $130.16 $97.65 No Bid
20" x 3/4" Service Saddle - ClI . . . .
Ford #EC202-2220-CC3 5 $268.95 $176.58 No Bid No Bid $162.54 No Bid $342.45 $164.06 No Bid
20" x 1" Service Saddle - CI Ford . . . .
HEC202-2220-CCA 5 $268.95 $176.58 No Bid No Bid $162.54 No Bid $342.45 $164.06 No Bid
20" x 2" Service Saddle - CI Ford . . . .
4FC202-2220-1P7 5 $281.70 $211.00 No Bid No Bid $194.22 No Bid $358.73 $196.02 No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: December 20, 2024 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson Border States
TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES AND SERVICE SADDLES (CONTINUED)
¢ #'\ggi‘(’ﬂ%%‘gg"l”g 15 $342.00 $425.50 No Bid No Bid $375.84 $350.00 $449.09 $375.81 No Bid
¥ #'\gngggc?‘;‘gg"l”g 10 $387.00 $470.30 No Bid No Bid $425.61 $395.00 $508.54 $425.56 No Bid
¢ A'p#z"’l‘_gaif"’gé_"?_Toh(;eads 5 $295.00 $326.13 No Bid No Bid $301.70 $300.00 $507.80 $295.10 No Bid
¥ A'p#z"’l‘_gaif"’gé_;lh(;eads 5 $413.00 $455.98 No Bid No Bid $421.92 $421.00 $710.15 $412.70 No Bid
8" x 7-1/2" CI MJ Sleeve 10 $97.00 $104.88 No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid $106.31 $90.95 No Bid
12" x 7-1/2" CI MJ Sleeve 10 $197.00 $211.97 No Bid No Bid $201.50 No Bid $214.22 $183.81 No Bid
20" x 15" CI MJ Sleeve 2 $747.00 $887.23 No Bid No Bid $808.50 No Bid $859.52 $738.58 No Bid
CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER
4" x 18" x 20" 50 $18.00 No Bid $16.35 No Bid $21.00 No Bid $19.78 $16.84 No Bid
12" x 18" x 20" 50 $38.00 $54.33 $35.19 No Bid $44.50 No Bid $42.48 $36.34 No Bid
18" x 18" x 20" 50 $40.00 $67.58 $36.96 No Bid $47.00 No Bid $44.74 $38.11 No Bid
VALVE BOX / VALVE BOX FRAME
Valve B &Top 25 $183.00 $218.82 $170.00 No Bid $237.50 No Bid $171.49 $180.42 $211.00
z C'l?j’ifqﬁ:gigﬁg% Box 100 $145.00 $137.38 No Bid No Bid $147.50 No Bid $111.23 $141.96 No Bid
COPPER - TYPE K
3/4" Copper - 60' Coil 1,500 ft. $6.65 $7.67 No Bid No Bid $6.11 $5.98 $5.84 $5.87 $7.36
1" Copper - 60' Coil 120 ft. $7.65 $10.18 No Bid No Bid $8.12 $7.94 $7.77 $7.80 $9.78
1" Copper - 100' Coil 500 ft. $7.65 $10.18 No Bid No Bid $8.12 $7.94 $7.77 $7.80 $9.78
PVC AND DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE
6" PVC Water Pipe 600 ft. $8.35 $9.43 No Bid No Bid $7.72 No Bid No Bid $8.11 No Bid
8" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. $14.85 $15.83 No Bid No Bid $12.97 No Bid No Bid $13.61 No Bid
10" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 18 ft. $53.60 $55.63 No Bid No Bid $54.01 No Bid No Bid $54.09 No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: December 20, 2024 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson Border States
PVC AND DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE (CONTINUED)
20" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 18 ft. $128.15 $133.93 No Bid No Bid $129.24 No Bid No Bid $129.40 No Bid
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
4" MJ 22.5° 5 $51.00 $57.41 No Bid No Bid $54.50 No Bid $54.32 $49.78 No Bid
6" MJ In-line Valve Mueller 10 $890.00 $1,248.80 No Bid No Bid $935.50 No Bid $908.14 No Bid No Bid
#A-2361-23
6" MJ Flex Adapter Coated 10 $291.00 $335.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $315.00 $291.31 No Bid
6" Megalug Retainer for PVC w/ 50 $53.00 $78.56 No Bid No Bid $66.80 No Bid $55.56 $56.19 No Bid
Accessories
6" Split Megalug Retainer for PVCw/ | = ¢ $121.00 $130.90 No Bid No Bid $100.57 No Bid $118.20 $55.07 No Bid
Accessories
6" Split Megalug Retainer for DI w/ 20 $82.00 $139.43 No Bid No Bid $87.38 No Bid $116.16 $117.25 No Bid
Accessories
6" MJ Accessory Kit 50 $30.50 $34.22 No Bid No Bid $32.50 No Bid $31.89 $21.64 No Bid
6" Transition Gasket 25 $8.50 $7.73 No Bid No Bid $7.50 No Bid $7.56 $9.71 No Bid
6" MJ 45° 15 $85.00 $96.60 No Bid No Bid $92.00 No Bid $90.29 $83.77 No Bid
6" MJ 90° 15 $104.00 $119.23 No Bid No Bid $113.50 No Bid $111.27 $103.39 No Bid
6" MJ Tee 2 $150.00 $171.19 No Bid No Bid $162.50 No Bid $161.12 $148.39 No Bid
6" MJ Cap 5 $43.00 $48.58 No Bid No Bid $46.50 No Bid $46.10 $42.12 No Bid
6" MJ Cap w/ 2" Threads 5 $68.00 $77.83 No Bid No Bid $74.00 No Bid $73.22 $67.49 No Bid
8" MJ In-line Valve Mueller 5 $1,416.00 $2,063.10 No Bid No Bid $1,488.59 No Bid $1,431.83 No Bid No Bid
#A-2361-23
8" MJ 45° 5 $124.00 $140.76 No Bid No Bid $134.00 No Bid $131.50 $122.06 No Bid
8" MJ Cap 2 $71.00 $79.49 No Bid No Bid $75.50 No Bid $74.47 $68.93 No Bid
8" MJ Cap w/ 2" Threads 2 $95.00 $108.19 No Bid No Bid $103.00 No Bid $102.66 $93.82 No Bid
8" MJ Foster Adapter - Epoxy Coated 5 $150.00 $180.17 No Bid No Bid $169.95 No Bid $185.58 $184.07 No Bid
8" MJ Anchor C;’“SF:;%Q Swivel 4 $232.00 $259.33 No Bid No Bid $236.50 No Bid $916.13 $215.88 No Bid
8" Megalug Retainer for PVC w/ 20 $74.00 $110.32 No Bid No Bid $89.34 No Bid $77.97 $75.67 No Bid
Accessories




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: December 20, 2024 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson Border States
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS (CONTINUED)
8" Split Megalug Retainer for PVC w/ 25 $132.00 $138.38 No Bid No Bid $109.87 No Bid $129.12 $91.78 No Bid
Accessories
8" Split Megalug Retainer for DI w/ 20 $129.00 $171.68 No Bid No Bid $107.47 No Bid $148.57 $66.60 No Bid
Accessories
10" MJ 45° 5 $178.00 $203.14 No Bid No Bid $193.00 No Bid $199.98 $176.15 No Bid
20" Megalug Retainer for DI w/ 6 $359.00 $526.67 No Bid No Bid $398.87 No Bid $373.57 $371.24 No Bid
Accessories
2" Brass Gate Valve - Hammond 645 15 No Bid $294.86 No Bid No Bid $29.44 No Bid $191.09 No Bid No Bid
2" Meter Flange Kit - Brass 20 $72.00 $102.04 No Bid No Bid $67.01 No Bid $87.22 $64.30 No Bid
INFRA-RISER VALVE BOX RISERS
1" x 18" x 20" 50 $44.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.28 No Bid $36.50 No Bid No Bid
WATER METERS
5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter - iPERL 1,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $232.23 $343.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5/8" x 3/4" Water Meter - Ally 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $683.65 $660.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Water Meter 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $360.35 $433.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Water Meter 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,312.47 $1,854.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant Meter 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,907.78 $3,009.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sensus 520M Smart Point 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $256.58 $180.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
i@ﬁ?ﬁé@?goﬁﬁg'f 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.25 $23.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SJZfe“fp‘?fﬂffj,?Sﬂ 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.50 $36.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sensus Antenna Locking Nut 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.63 $8.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MUNICIPEX
3/4" Municipex 1,500 ft $0.75 $0.85 $0.73 No Bid $1.10 No Bid $0.77 $0.7377 $0.41
1" Municipex 1,500 ft $1.15 $1.28 $1.11 No Bid $1.64 No Bid $1.17 $1.12 $0.69
2" Municipex 1,000 ft $7.20 $7.94 $6.83 No Bid $10.18 No Bid $6.97 $6.96 $2.39
3/4" Insert 250 $0.30 $0.35 No Bid No Bid $1.79 No Bid $0.37 $0.37 No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: December 20, 2024 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson Border States
MUNICIPEX (CONTINUED)
1" Insert 100 $0.40 $0.45 No Bid No Bid $1.88 No Bid $0.38 $0.42 No Bid
2" Insert 50 $2.50 $2.99 No Bid No Bid $2.55 No Bid $2.97 $1.71 No Bid
REPAIR CLAMPS
2 x - 2";;'(;3;3'_‘32%‘?‘%" “Pveiel g $48.75 $62.17 $57.22 No Bid $57.23 No Bid $56.00 $56.90 $93.53
3 x 7'1/F2;r2”;'|§i_f(')%g?mp -cl 2 $55.95 $68.75 $63.27 No Bid $63.28 No Bid $65.00 $62.92 $113.84
3" x 12" Full Circle Clamp - CI - Ford) 5 $93.25 $103.03 $94.83 No Bid $94.84 No Bid $108.00 $94.30 $189.75
#F1-400-125
4 74/5;;“;'5_?5_3';““" ~cl 5 $62.00 $70.22 $64.63 No Bid $64.64 No Bid $72.00 $64.27 $126.34
6" x ZOF";;'LSI_C;‘;E'Z%ED - c 10 $244.00 $180.90 $166.51 No Bid $166.52 No Bid $281.00 $168.07 $401.58
6" x 24;;;';?{?;232%3" - c 5 $298.00 $234.53 $215.87 No Bid $215.88 No Bid $347.00 $217.90 $489.72
127x 12" F“;!Fcli_rlcé‘;g'fgp "Gl Fordi g $219.00 $166.78 $153.51 No Bid $153.52 No Bid $255.00 $154.95 $489.72
167x Zggzuggfiﬁzg_'gomp - c 2 $865.00 $422.95 $385.33 No Bid $389.31 No Bid $1,008.00 $392.96 $1,619.76
167 32;;“232523'3?'0 - c 2 $1,737.00 $686.96 $625.87 No Bid $632.33 No Bid $2,024.00 $638.25 $2,011.20
20X 22;;“23;'2643'%“'0 - c 1 $965.00 $506.80 $461.73 No Bid $466.50 No Bid $1,125.00 $470.86 $1,656.24
20X 32;;“233'2643'3?'0 - c 1 $1,461.00 $766.67 $698.50 No Bid $705.71 No Bid $1,700.00 $712.31 $2,252.59
24X Zg;rzugggfsg_'%“p - c 1 $1,652.00 $888.04 $804.07 No Bid $817.42 No Bid $1,920.00 $825.07 $1,737.99
24X 32;;“223583'2?'0 - c 1 $2,499.00 $1,343.41 $1,223.94 No Bid $1,236.57 No Bid $2,910.00 $1,229.60 $2,629.77
WATER METER BOX
Water Meter Box & Lid 100 $59.40 $64.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $54.00 $53.63 No Bid
Water Meter Box Lid Only 150 $24.65 $27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $18.00 $17.35 No Bid
Water Meter Box Extension 50 $18.45 $36.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 $19.94 $18.93 No Bid
Cl Water Mete! Sox &t Siama) 59 $105.00 $145.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.00 $115.00 $128.41 No Bid
FIRE HYDRANTS
Fire Hyaran! By o 10 $2,998.00 $2,983.00 $2,873.00 No Bid $2,985.28 No Bid $3,055.59 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: December 20, 2024 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson Border States
FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSIONS & TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS
Fire Hydrant Traffic Repair Kit - M&H 10 No Bid $337.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $174.34 No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant 1raffic Repair Kit - 5 $330.00 $442.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $168.11 No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant Traffic Repair Kit - 5 No Bid $422.40 No Bid No Bid $333.96 No Bid $144.34 No Bid No Bid
American Darling
Fir Hydrant TraFffii;eREpa" Kit- US 5 No Bid $470.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $163.02 No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant Extension Kit - M&H, 12" 2 No Bid $784.94 No Bid No Bid $534.09 No Bid $428.60 No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant Extension Kit - M&H, 18" 2 No Bid $988.76 No Bid No Bid $608.03 No Bid $490.99 No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant Extension Kit - M&H, 24" 2 No Bid $1,074.08 No Bid No Bid $686.33 No Bid $544.46 No Bid No Bid
INSERTION VALVES

4" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 $5,832.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,971.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 3 $6,736.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,656.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 3 $8,063.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,570.899 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 $13,708.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,551.042 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 $16,599.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,440.556 No Bid No Bid No Bid

MISCELLANEOUS WATER MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR MATERIALS
3/4" x 3-1/2" T-Bolt w/ Nut 100 $2.70 $2.53 No Bid No Bid $2.48 No Bid $2.53 $1.97 No Bid
347 xSy/2" AntiRomation T-Bolt Wi 400 $4.30 $4.38 No Bid No Bid $3.96 No Bid $4.04 $4.37 No Bid
3/4" x 4-1/2" Eye Bolt w/ Nut 250 $4.25 $4.33 No Bid No Bid $3.67 No Bid $3.50 $3.25 No Bid
3/4" x 10 ft. All Thread Rod 250 $2.50 $3.54 No Bid No Bid $1.73 No Bid $2.65 $2.37 No Bid
34 ng’iiﬂﬁg rod Hex 100 $1.40 $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.05 No Bid $1.44 $1.51 No Bid
3/4" Heavy Hex Nuts 500 $0.45 $0.53 No Bid No Bid $0.43 No Bid $0.50 $0.44 No Bid
3/4" Heavy Flat Washers 500 $0.30 $0.33 No Bid No Bid $0.27 No Bid $0.30 $0.28 No Bid
Duc Lugs 100 $3.50 $6.33 No Bid No Bid $5.11 No Bid $3.16 $3.96 No Bid
5/8" x 2-1/2" Hex Head Bolt w/ Nut 100 $0.90 $1.14 No Bid No Bid $0.49 No Bid $0.98 $0.99 No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE:

December 20, 2024 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Consolidated Pipe

G&C Supply

Southern Pipe

Core & Main

Hayes Pipe

CITCO Water

Fortiline

Ferguson

Border States

TIE BID AT $0.74 - AWARDED TO SOUTHERN PIPE AT $0.73

TIE BID AT $1.50 - AWARDED TO CONSOLIDATED PIPE AT $1.40

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS




