CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: March 6, 2026 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson
BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS
172" Meter Coupling 25 10.85 10.31 9.73 0.85 0.74 10.05 9.82 9.95
Ford #C38-11-2.375-NL $10. $10. $9. $9. $9. $10. $9. $9.
3/4" Female Adapter
Ford #014 330 L 25 $18.15 $19.01 $17.94 $18.15 $17.95 $18.50 $18.12 $18.34
3/4" x 1" Coupling
Ford #C44.34QNL 25 $23.00 $25.56 $24.12 $24.41 $24.14 $24.90 $24.38 $24.66
3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp
Ford #B44. 233N 75 $49.20 $51.40 $48.97 $49.53 $49.00 $50.40 $49.50 $50.05
3/4" Meter Coupling 25 33.45 11.73 11.07 11.20 11.08 11.40 11.17 11.32
Ford #C38-23-2-NL $33. $11. $11. $11. $11. $11. $11. $11.
3/4" x 4" Brass Nipple 25 $6.45 $8.28 $7.31 $6.82 $6.67 $4.99 No Bid $6.86
3/4" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 $9.45 $12.10 $10.69 $9.96 $9.73 $7.19 No Bid $10.04
1" Female Adapter
Ford #O14.4400NL 15 $25.90 $25.78 $24.33 $24.61 $24.35 $25.00 $24.57 $24.87
1" Meter Coupling 25 37.50 17.56 16.57 16.77 16.58 17.00 16.75 16.94
Ford #C38-44-2-NL $37. $17. $ $16. $16. $17. $16. $16.
1" x1"x 3/4" Tee 25 $56.45 $58.48 $55.19 $55.83 $55.23 $57.00 $55.79 $56.40
Ford #T444-443-Q-NL
2" Male Adapter
Ford #08A ST ML 25 $80.55 $84.59 $80.61 $81.51 $80.64 $83.00 $81.47 $82.36
2" Male Coupling
e HOTT. TN 25 $107.25 $158.01 $150.57 $153.69 $152.08 $156.70 $153.65 $155.29
2" x CL Brass Nipple 25 $12.65 $14.99 $14.66 $13.66 $13.36 $9.86 No Bid $13.77
2" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 $28.40 $33.65 $35.29 $32.88 $32.13 $23.75 No Bid $30.92
TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES, AND SERVICE SADDLES
6" x 3/4" Service Saddle - PVC
Eord HEC209.669.003 10 $93.70 $82.27 $77.65 $80.19 $78.50 $105.00 $78.52 $63.72
6" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC
1 AL C202.660-CC4 5 $93.70 $82.27 $77.65 $80.19 $78.50 $105.00 $78.52 $63.72
6" x 2" Service Saddle - PVC
o #R 0202669177 5 $112.30 $88.79 $83.79 $86.54 $84.71 $113.70 $84.74 $78.51
6" x 3/4" Service Saddle - Cl
o 4P Co09.700.C03 15 $93.70 $82.27 $77.65 $80.19 $78.50 $105.50 $78.52 $63.72
8" x 3/4" Service Saddle - Cl
o 4P C209.070.C03 5 $110.70 $94.31 $89.01 $91.92 $89.98 $120.70 $90.00 $74.46
16" x 2" Service Saddle - Cl
o e A eD09.1840.1P7 2 $224.00 $164.80 $156.85 $162.13 $157.09 $213.00 $158.75 $162.13
24" x 3/4" Service Saddle - Cl
e HECP02.9650.C03 2 $403.00 $211.53 $201.49 $208.10 $201.63 $273.00 $203.77 $208.10
4" Macro Coupling 5 $322.00 $323.41 $389.99 $349.46 $306.65 $309.80 No Bid $355.21

#261-0560831




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: March 6, 2026 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson
TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES, AND SERVICE SADDLES (CONTINUED)
¢ #'\ggff?ﬂ%%‘g;”g 10 $425.00 $415.67 $504.70 $461.17 $404.69 $408.90 No Bid $463.00
¥ #'\ggffggi‘;‘g;”g 5 $481.00 $497.86 $571.52 $522.24 $458.27 $463.00 No Bid $525.78
6" Alpha Coupling 10 $534.00 $574.35 $598.98 $602.48 $553.05 $553.50 No Bid $531.99
#ALPHA-A-7.00
6" Alpha Cap £C.7.00 #ALPHA- 5 $353.00 $379.76 $396.29 $398.36 $365.67 $369.10 No Bid $412.39
¢ A'Zﬁgﬂ%}"’éé_"?_Tohgeads 5 $493.00 $531.10 $552.17 $557.10 $511.39 $516.80 No Bid $427.88
4" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve 5 $82.00 $88.71 $236.99 $83.40 $79.53 $81.20 No Bid $101.23
16" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve 3 $653.00 $697.33 $479.98 $685.35 $653.55 $667.30 No Bid $918.59
CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER
4" x 18" x 20" 50 $17.00 No Bid $16.46 $16.41 $19.80 No Bid $16.65 $18.38
6" x 18" x 20" 100 $25.95 No Bid $25.41 $25.65 $30.21 No Bid $25.40 $25.63
12" x 18" x 20" 100 $36.65 No Bid $35.92 $36.73 $42.71 No Bid $35.90 $37.88
18" x 18" x 20" 25 $38.50 No Bid $37.29 $38.58 $44.80 No Bid $37.66 $39.73
PVC AND DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE
6" PVC Water Pipe 600 ft. $6.65 $7.06 $6.43 $8.65 $6.31 No Bid $6.29 $6.41
8" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 36 ft. $43.75 $12.62 $43.50 $43.06 $43.73 No Bid $43.73 $43.73
10" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 18 ft. $57.35 $50.64 $57.01 $56.44 $57.32 No Bid $57.31 $57.32
12" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 18 ft. $72.20 $64.56 $71.78 $71.06 $72.17 No Bid $72.16 $72.17
16" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 36 ft. $104.45 $95.03 $103.88 $102.84 $104.43 No Bid $104.43 $103.37
24" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 18 ft. $170.15 $178.00 $171.02 $169.30 $171.94 No Bid $171.92 $171.94
36" Ductile Iron Water Pipe 18 ft. $367.70 $322.94 $369.62 $365.85 $367.74 No Bid $371.56 $365.85




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: March 6, 2026 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
6" MJ Foster Adapier Fpoxy Coated - 5 $140.55 $133.71 $103.33 $142.06 $124.42 No Bid $120.57 $141.21
6" MJ Flex Coupling 10 $291.60 $307.95 $338.00 $242.38 No Bid No Bid $288.61 $262.62
6" Megalug Retainer for PVC w/ 25 $76.00 $71.75 $67.89 $67.90 $69.49 No Bid $60.31 $67.38
Accessories
8" MJ Flex Coupling 5 $310.00 No Bid $319.00 $310.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $306.60
8" Megalug Retainer for PVC w/ .
Accessories 25 $101.00 $93.16 $93.00 $91.44 $93.07 No Bid $81.22 $90.91
3/4" Brass Gate Valve - Hammond 645 5 No Bid $104.96 $61.05 $14.75 $68.79 No Bid No Bid $59.28
1-1/2" Brass Gate Valve - Hammond 645 5 No Bid $235.54 $133.44 $36.37 $154.41 No Bid No Bid $133.08
2" Brass Gate Valve - Hammond 645 15 No Bid $107.84 $175.37 $51.09 $201.78 No Bid No Bid $167.40
INFRA-RISER VALVE BOX RISERS
1/2" x 18" x 20" 25 $32.00 No Bid $32.30 $33.35 $34.46 No Bid No Bid $34.45
1" x 18" x 20" 75 $34.00 No Bid $34.03 $35.13 $35.52 No Bid No Bid $35.15
1-1/2" x 18" x 20" 75 $52.25 No Bid $52.80 $54.51 $55.10 No Bid No Bid $54.50
2" x 18" x 20" 50 $68.00 No Bid $68.06 $70.26 $71.03 No Bid No Bid $70.30
3"x 18" x 20" 75 $102.70 No Bid $101.98 $106.03 $106.03 No Bid No Bid $103.00
WATER METERS
5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter - iPERL 1,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $359.75 No Bid No Bid
5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter - IPERL 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $397.00 No Bid No Bid
Residential Fire Service Rated
5/8" x 3/4" Water Meter - Ally 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Bid No Bid
1" Water Meter - iPERL 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $445.75 No Bid No Bid
1" Water Meter - iPERL  Residential 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $477.00 No Bid No Bid
Fire Service Rated
4" Sensus OMNI C2 Water Meter 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,085.00 No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant Meter 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,490.00 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: March 6, 2026 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson
WATER METERS (CONTINUED)
Sensus 520M Smart Point 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.00 No Bid No Bid
Sensus Antenna Locking Nut 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid
MUNICIPEX
3/4" Municipex 3,000 ft. $0.75 $0.90 $0.73 $0.75 $0.72 $0.73 $0.73 $0.7300
1" Municipex 1,500 ft $1.15 $1.40 $1.10 $1.13 $1.10 $1.10 $1.09 $1.15
2" Municipex 1,000 ft $6.95 $7.94 $6.75 $6.97 $6.76 $6.83 $6.81 $6.82
3/4" Insert 250 $0.50 $0.40 $0.33 $1.97 $0.30 $0.44 $0.61 $0.43
MUNICIPEX (CONTINUED)
1" Insert 50 $0.60 $0.48 $0.39 $1.74 $0.37 $0.38 $0.79 $0.49
2" Insert 75 $3.95 $3.71 $2.87 $2.75 No Bid $2.88 $2.86 $2.00
REPAIR CLAMPS
Zxr-Al ZFF;‘r'C'j g;ﬁ'zggf‘%p -Pveicl g $52.00 $63.05 $59.49 $61.46 $60.16 $61.00 $60.18 $67.77
2 x 12 i‘;'r' dC;rFC:‘fZ%';_TSS' pveict 5 $82.00 $91.85 $86.67 $89.53 $87.64 $88.70 $87.67 $88.60
3"x 12" Full Circle Clamp - CI - Ford 5 $96.00 $97.06 $91.60 $94.60 $92.61 $93.70 $92.62 $93.62
#F1-370-125
X oo~ Ve 5 $64.00 $87.65 $61.22 $63.23 $61.89 $62.70 $61.88 $62.57
Axaz Pul Hirole Clamp - PVC 5 $108.00 $99.31 $93.72 $96.79 $94.75 $95.75 $94.77 $95.79
6" x 12";‘:('}: :gﬁgsgﬂ”;g - PVe 10 $76.00 $112.28 $105.95 $109.44 $107.13 $108.00 $107.15 $71.10
6" x 74@;2”;;{?'294%”“" - c 20 $78.00 $73.71 $69.55 $71.85 $70.33 $71.00 $70.35 $117.39
6" x 12;;3'Lgi1r_°7'2f182”;p - ¢l 5 $125.00 $114.35 $107.49 $111.46 $109.10 $110.10 $109.12 $110.30
8" x 12" Full Circle Clamp - CI Ford 5 $149.00 $121.71 $114.85 $118.63 $116.14 $117.20 $116.15 $176.33
#F1-939-125
10"x 1F2c:rgﬁlF(2:zC1l?)ﬁl132rgp - ¢l 5 $173.00 $156.04 $146.98 $152.09 $148.88 $150.50 $148.92 $150.50
16" x 24" Ful Circle Clamp - Cl 2 $1,089.00 $1,144.05 $609.95 $632.54 $619.35 $625.70 $619.40 $625.95

Ford #F2-1830-24




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: March 6, 2026 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline Ferguson
WATER METER BOX
Water Meter Box & Lid 250 $64.20 $74.40 $53.81 $56.78 $56.05 $58.00 $38.22 $57.87
Water Meter Box Extension 50 $16.85 $20.40 $12.75 $13.45 $17.28 $19.00 $17.19 $17.90
Cl Water Metelrvl%%x?g‘T“d Sigma 25 $121.50 $159.24 $104.65 $110.30 $106.30 $121.50 $120.20 $105.85
Cl Water Metel\r/lgg;;}d Sigma |4 $42.50 $159.24 $36.98 $38.61 $37.22 $42.50 $42.06 $37.79
FIRE HYDRANTS
Fire Hydrj‘gf g"fr;' #129-T, 25 $3,185.00 $3,122.39 $3,059.94 $3,111.20 $3,317.89 No Bid $3,084.30 $3,365.00
2" PLASTIC WATER METER BOX
2" Plastic Meter Box & Lid 10 No Bid $340.92 No Bid $140.00 $220.00 No Bid $353.50 $435.00
FLUSHING HYDRANTS
Flushing Hydrant 10 $775.00 $936.38 $754.49 $915.33 $935.44 $898.000 $877.58 $858.07
MARKER SIGNS
U-Channel Posts, #2, Green, 8 ft. 250 No Bid $19.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.50
MISCELLANEOUS WATER MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR MATERIALS
3/4" x 3-1/2" T-Bolt w/ Nut 100 $3.70 $4.31 No Bid $15.04 $3.71 No Bid $3.66 $1.12
34" x 5" A”“'R‘,\’ltjt“"” T-Bolt  w/ 100 $10.40 $11.83 No Bid $10.26 $4.32 No Bid $10.38 $7.81
3/4" x 4-1/2" Eye Bolt w/ Nut 250 $3.70 $4.76 No Bid $3.50 $4.32 No Bid $3.89 $3.30
3/4" x 10 ft. All Thread Rod 500 $2.30 $3.33 No Bid $4.06 $3.77 No Bid $2.45 $2.12
34" ng‘ﬁﬁg Eﬁ? Hex 100 $1.50 $2.81 No Bid $2.09 $2.03 No Bid $1.19 $5.26
3/4" Heavy Hex Nuts 500 $0.45 $0.56 No Bid $0.76 $0.42 No Bid $0.41 $0.784
3/4" Heavy Flat Washers 500 $0.26 $0.38 No Bid $0.46 $0.26 No Bid $0.25 $0.839
Duc Lugs 100 $3.65 $5.94 No Bid $4.70 $5.06 No Bid $3.37 $4.66
5/8" x 2-1/2" Hex Head Bolt w/ Nut 100 $1.50 $1.28 No Bid $2.12 $0.50 No Bid $0.88 $2.00

TIE BID AT $1.10 - AWARDED TO FORTILINE AT $1.09




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: March 6, 2026 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description

Qty

Consolidated Pipe

G&C Supply

Southern Pipe Core & Main

Hayes Pipe

CITCO Water

Fortiline

Ferguson

TIE BID AT $32.30 - AWARDED TO CONSOLIDATED PIPE AT $32.00

TIE BID AT $52.80 - AWARDED TO CONSOLIDATED PIPE AT $52.25

TIE BID AT $0.42 - AWARDED TO FORTILINE AT $0.41

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS




